CB Training Fall 2011

Muine S Planaing Ok i

Michael Lessard

Commercial Building Code
of Maine

10/19/2011

Agenda

o Tille i Degarment of Public Safely
635 {new) Bureau of Building Codes and Slandards
o Coursetime 12 houss
o Overviewof the Commercial Building Code
o Certification Process
o Timeline
o Enforcement
o Resources for Information
o Navigatingthe Code

—

The New Standard

Title 16 Department of Public Safety
635 (new) Bureau of Building Codes and Standards -
Maine Uniform Buiiding and Energy Code

Chapter3 Commercial Building Cede of Maine

Overview of the
International Building
Code (IBC)

MUBEC?

Purpose and Scope
Authority

incorporated by Refersnce
Excluded from Adoption
Codes that Continue in Effect

,/’&ﬁ;ﬂ
Commercial Building Code

the Maine Uniform Building and Energy Code
(MUBEC)

Fhe provisions of this chapler ara based on a nationally recognized model

part of the MUBEC through incorporation by reference.

Building coda by local bulding officiats in municipalities with a poputation of
mora than 4,000 residents.

Establishes Commercial Building code component of

building code published by the Infernational Gade Counell, Ing., and is made

This chapter also contalns requirements for the enfercemeant of the Commercial

T e

’/
Purpose and Scope

o All building construction in Maine, with some exceptions, is
governad by the MUBEC, which is adopted by the Technical
Building Codes and Standards Board pursvant o 10 M.R.S,
Chapter 1103.

The primary objective of the Board is to establish a
uniform building code throughout the State of Maine.




CB Training Fall 2011

Purpose and Scope

o Chapter3 sets forth the standards for the construction,
alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair,
equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance,
removal and demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances cennected or attached {o such building or
structure, with the exception of detached one- and tao-family
dwellings and townhouses,

Adopted Codes and Standards

The Commercial Buiding Code of Malne has adopled
the following:

o International Buiiding Code — 2009
{in part - detai’s to foliow)

Todownload rules that detail the amendments to the code, go to
waw. maine gowdpsbbes

The following Chapters of the 2009 International Building
Code, published by the International Code Coundif, Inc.,
are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference:

Chapler t2 Interior Environment

Chapler 13 Energy Efficieacy

Chapter 14 Exterior Walls

Chapler 15 Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Struclures
Chapler16 Structural Design

Chapler 17 Structural Tests and Specialinspactions
Chapter18 Soils and Foundations

Chapter 19 Concrete

Chapter 20 Aluminum

Chapter2t Masonry

10/19/2011

Authority

a The authority for this Chapteris 10 MR.S. 9722, which
provides that the Maine Technical Buikling Codes and
Standards Board shall promulgate rules which adopt, amend,
and maintain the Maine Uniform Building and Energy Code.

Incorporation by Reference

The following Chaplers of the 2008 International Building
Code, published by the International Code Council, Inc., are
hereby adopled and incorporated by reference:

Chapter 1 Administralion

Chapter 2 Definitions

Chapler3 Use and Occupancy Classifications

Chapler4 Special Detalled Requirements Based on
Use and Cc¢eupancy

Chapter5 General Building Helght and Areas

Chapters Types of Construction

Chapter? Fire-Resislance-Rated Conslruction

Chapter$ [aterior Finishes

Chapter® Fire Protection Systems

Chapter 10 Means of Egress

Incorporation by Reference

The foltowing Chapters of the 2809 International Building Code,
published by the International Code Coundil, Inc., are hereby
adopted and incorperated by reference:

Chapler2? Steel

Chapler23 Wood

Chapter24 Glass and Glazing
Chapler26 Gypsum Board and Piaster
Chapler28 Plastic

Chapter 27  Eleclricat

Chapter 31 Special Construction g
Chapler 32 Encreachments inlo the Public Right of Way
Chapler 33 Safeguards During Conslruction
Chapler34 Existing Structures

Chapler35 Referenced Standards




CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

b’ | -
Excluded from Adoption Alternative Approaches
Chapter 11 Accessibity
Chapter 28 Mechanical Systems
Chapter 20 Pimbing Systems The International Existing Butiding Code {IEBC} provides
Chapler 30 Elevators and Comuying Systems alternative approaches to remadeling, repair, and/or
AppendicA-K alteration of existing commercial buildings

in lisu of complying with the
IBC requirements.

Alternative Approaches

Certification Standards

Any cutside training that you receive on the IEBC will be
recognized by the SPO for recertification credit in the [BC.

Certification Standards Certification Standards

For Buiiging Officials and Third Party Inspectors

There are six new standards in which buikiing officials

The training 2nd cerlification committee of the Technica may be certified.

Buitding Codes and Standards Board shall determine the
standards for certifying butiding officials and third-party
inspectors.

International Resldential Code (IRC)
Internationat Building Code (iBC)
Residential Enargy Code (IECC)
Commerclal Energy Code {[ECC)
Residential Ventilation Code
Commercial Ventilation Code

Standards shall enumerate the knowledge and training required to
ensure that building officials and third-parly inspectors have the
basic understanding needed fo apply the MUBEC and the ongoing
education needed {o slay current with code changes and
amendments. [0 Radon ~ Registration now required ]

cCcoCCo0




CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Advisory Rulings and Technical “Advisory Rulings and Technical

Support Support

Written Request
The interpretation: and enforcement of this Code are

the respoasibility of the iocal municipality. Upon written request of any interested persca or entity,
the Bureau may provide a nonbinding advisory

However, the Bureau is available to provide advisory inferpretation with respect to the applicability of any

rulings and technical support for the administration statute, rule or code administered by the Bureaw, on that

of this Code, amendmants, confiict resolutions, and person o7 entity, or the property of that person or enbity,

inferpretations. This supportincludes but is not or actual stale of facts.

limited to:

Thewritten request shall be made on the official Bureau form
and shall include the following information:

“Advisory Rulings and Technical
Support

Written Request Shall include:

o Spedificidentification of the subject code or codes with a
description of ihe questioned application o perceived
conflict.

o Relevant construction documents to fully fitustrate the issue The technical support shall also include:

upon which an advisory Interpretationis sought.

Written, non binding advisory Interpretation

o The Bureau may request additional documentation or
information required to issue ar advisoryinterprelation or to
provide technical support. All requested information shall be
previdedwithin 30 days of request, or the request for
advisory Interpretation or support may be deemed
@bandened,

‘“/"4@@5“‘. . ’./es-a-"
Other Considerations MUBEC does not apply to

o Procedure for code amendment « Log homes or manufactured homes defined in
Chapter 951.
o Procedures for identifying and resolving confiicls
between this Code and the Fire Safety Codesand o Postand beam or timber frame construction.
standards, L : B :

Be o Warehouses or silos used o store ¢rops.
o Experimental budings ;. RN -

o Seasonally reslricted éoﬁages.‘

o Native lumber - -5




CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Timeline

Timeline

No later than December 1, 2010, this Code must be
enforced in a municipality with a population of 4,000
rasidents or more that had previously adopted any
building code on or before August 1, 2008.

Timeline

The provisicns of the MUBEC do not apply to
municipalities with a population of less than 4,000
residents, except to the extent that the municipalily has
No later than July 1, 2012, this adopted that code,

Coda must be enforced in a
municipafity with a population of
4,000 residents or more that had
not adopted any building code on or
before August 1, 2008.

/¢- R . '
MUBEC Components Municipalities Under 4,000

Effective September 2011, al towns under 4,000 in population

Maine Uniform Building Code — That portion of the have the following optiens:
MUBEC that does not cantain energy code requirements
as determined by the board pursuant to section 9722, 1. Chose to adopt and enforce the MUBEC.

subsection 8, paragraph L.
2. Choose fo adopt and enforce MUBC only.

Maine Uniform Energy Gode — That portion of the
MUBEC that contains only energy code requiremenis as 3. Choose to adopt and enforce MUEC only.
detesmined by the board pursuant o section 9722, 4. Choose to have 1o code.

subsection 6, paragraph L,




CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Timeline

Enforcement

Effactive December 1, 2010, except as provided in 10
MR.S.  9724{4)and 9725, any ordinance regarding any
building code of any political subdivision of the State that
is inconsistent with the MUBEC s vold, with the following
exception:

This provision does not apply to any adopted fire & life
safety code, fire safety ordinance or any land use
ordinance, including Land Use Regulatory Commission
rules.

Bullding Officials

Inspections performed by
butiding officials certified
pursuani to 30-AMR.S.
4451,

At
Enforcement Enforcement

Inspections by Virlue of Inter-locat Contracival Agreements

Agreements Inspections performed by virue of contractual
tnspections performed by virtue of infer-local agreaments agreements with one of maore municipalities, or
with other munigipalitias, that share the use of building county or regional authorities, that share the use of
officials, certified in building standards pursuant to 30-A building officials cedified in buidding standards
MRS, 4451 pursuantto JOMR.S. 9723,




CB Training Fall 2011

e T

Enforcement

Third Parly Inspecticn by Report

Inspections performed and verified by repods from
a TPI, certified pursuant to 10 MRS, 9723,

Required Inspections

110.2 Prsliminary Inspeetion {prior fo Issuance of permit
110.3 Required Inspections

110.3.1  Footing and Foundaticns

10.3.2 Cconerete Slab and Under Floor

110.3.3  Lowest Floor Elavation

110.3.4  Frame

110,36  Lathand Gypsum Board

110.3.6  Fire and Smoke Resistant Penefrations

110.3.7  Energy Efficlency

116.3.8  Other Inspections

110.3.8  Special Inspections

{Secton 1704 Structural and Special Inspections)
110.3.10 Final inspection

|
Required Inspections

11105 Inspection Requests

it shall be the duly of the parmit holder or thelr agent fo
notify the building official that such work is ready for
inspection.

it shall be the duty of the person requesting any
inspections required by this code fo provide access
to and means for inspection of such work,

10/19/2011

e

Enforcement

Required Inspections

110.4 Inspection Agancies

The building official Is authorized to accept reports of
approved agencles, provided such agencles satisfy the
reguirements as o gualifications and refiaility.

Required Inspections

110.6 Approval Required

Waork shall not be done beyond the point indicated in
each successive inspection without first obtaining the
approval of the building official.




CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Resources for Information
Resources for Information

International Code Council

The International Residential Code {IRC}, 2009 edition.
300 New Jersey Avenue, NW, 6th Hoor

Washington, DC zo001

1-888-1CC-SAFE {422-7233)

}"ﬁﬂ T

Navigating the Code

: 1t cf in!ormateon and updates for .
1he new buﬂdiﬂg code progran Ly

Navigating the Code

International
Buifding Code

Cloarly, wa won't be. abIe to teach you al of the
1BG foday, however... /i R

uickl
AICKI




(B Training Fall 2011

" Chapters

PRt

f‘%

1BLE OF conEE
Pt
ENRRUER e The books are
T o broken down into
R A Chapters to discuss
RIS S NP e major categories of
et O < |information
a aprinet RN
Lariret et
uu:.\:‘:" l“'"""H‘!J\:;_“\n )
caaritl 4 e
ariths
geante MM
v B N - s
puarTted st
ok :

Lo

Patd danelidatee

Shapler 1:
Scope and Admindsir

st

General Comments

<
{
¢
{

Each chapler starls
with some general
comments aboui the
material that will be
covered.

This information can be
heipfutto when interpreting
code or trying to explain
detaiis to others.

General Commen

Pati—Admiaitrrihe

Chapter 1t
Scope and Administrallon

Zé
{

t_s

importance of the
chapter

Finally, a purpose
statementis provided
fo give specific
meaning and

onarE 0F CON

ReTTiy
P L

parparsd
s

Pl

sy

10/19/2011

TEHTS

e theMUBEC

Tosave lots of ime in the
future, you should highlight the
chapters that are included in

General Comments

Fad l-Ad ey s bee

The comments also
provide a briefing on
each section in the
chapter.

This gives you a speedy
snapshotof whatis

covered in each section.

Bcope and Adminlstration

4
Chapter 1: g
&




CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

< The commentary
foliows many of the
code references

Revisions to the IBC

Not att of the text in all sections are adopted by the State of
Maine.

Only the code is
enforceable

/-’/
Revisions to the [ECC

For up to date listings of all changes to the MUBEC, go
fo

www.maine.gov/dps/bbcs

EIMAL ALOPTION CASFTER § - ADMLISTRATION

FIMAL ACGPTION CAMTER 3 - T IRD- SARTY RiZPECTOR,

FINAL ACOPTION CHAPTER 3 - 16C [2299) Inbernateanil Buting Code

EIUAL ACOOTION CHAPTER 4 - JEEC (336] Internabizra' Exickng Sullng Cody

FIYEt ALCETION CHAFER S » IRG {200) Ereemmatori) Rédenta’ €Cd3

ELdAL ACOOTION CHMPTER 6 » LECC {2000} tnternabonl Erergy Consgrvaton Cody

10



CB Training Fall 2011

Revisions to the IBC

The following additions, Insertions, deletions, and olher changes are hereby
made to tha 2008 Intemational Buiding Code:

Generally aff sections
Delete “international Mechanical Code*
insert “applicable state codes and statues”

Saction 101.1
Delete [NAME OF JURISDICTICNY; and
Insert "State of Maine” in its place.

10/19/2011

Revisions to the IBC

Section 101.4.1

Eelete "International Fuel Gas Code and insert “NFPA 54
National Fue! Gas Code: Fire and safety codes and
slandards adopied pursuant fo Title 25, 2452 and 2465™ in
ils place.

Section 101.4.2 .
Dalete Section 101.4.1 "Mechanical” in its entirety, without
substitution.

Revisions to the IBC

Saction 101.4.3

Delete "internationat Plumbing Code and insert "Maine State
Plumbing Code, adopted pursuant to Title 32, 3404-B”inits
place.

Delete “International Private Sewage Disposal Codes”, and
Insert “Maine Stale Plumbing Code, adopted pursuant to
Title 32, 3404-B” in its place,

Revisions to the IBC

Section 101.4.4
Delete Section 101.4.4 "Property Maintenance® in it's
entirety, without substitution.

Revisions to the IBC

Section 101.4.5

Delete "International Fire Code™ and Insert NFPA#1: Fire
codes and standards adopted pursuant to Title 25, 2452
and 2465" in its place.

’-v/_
Revisions to the IBC

Seciion 102.6

Delete “International Property Maintonance Gods or the
International Fire Code™ and insert "NFPA #1; Fire Safety
Codes and standards adopied pursuant to Title 25, 2452
and 2465°in its place,

11



CB Training Fall 2011

o e T

Revisions to the IBC

Sectlon 103
Defete Section R103 “Department of Building Safety” in its
entirety, without substitution.

10/19/2011

Revisions to the IBC

Sections 104, 105, 106, 107, 188, 110, 111, 112, 1156 and 116
and any amendments thereto shall only be applicable:

A Ina municipatity with & poputation of 4,000 or more residents,
beginning:

(1) Notater than December 1, 2010, if the munkcipality had previously
adopled any buiding code on or befora August 1, 2008; or

{2) Nolater than July 1, 2042, if the municipality had not adopled any
bullding code on or before August 1, 2008,

B. Ina municipality with a poputation of fess than 4,000 reskients, if the
municipality voluniarly elects to enforce the MUBEC.

Revisions to the IBC

Section 105.1
tnsert “where required by municipal ordinance” at the end

of the paragraph.

Section 105.2

Insert "Structures exempt from permits shall be located in
compliance with zoning and flocdpiain regulations” at the
end of the paragraph.

Revisions to the IBC

Section 109
Delele Saction R109“Fees™ in iis antirefy, without
substitution.

Revisions to the IBC

Sections R113and R114
Delate Section R113 °Board of Appeals” and Saction R14
“Violations” in thelr entirety, without substituticn.

Revisions to the IBC

Section 308.5.2
Delata Section 308.5.2 and the exceptions thareto, in it's
entiraty, with substitution.

Section 404.6
Delete all language in Section 404.6 and Insert “See NFPA

101 8.8.7 {2009 edition)” in it's place.

12



CB Training Fall 2011

Revisions to the IBC

Section 715.4.8.1.1

Insert & new Section 715.4.8.1.1 to read: "Every door
assembly in a stair enclosure serving more than four {4}
stories shall permit re-entry from the enclosure to the inferior
of the building.

Exception: An automaltic release that is actuated with the
initiation of the building fire alarm or fire detection system
shall be provided fo unlock all stair enclosure door
assemblies to allow re-entry.

10/19/2011

Revisions to the IBC

Section 716.5.3
Delete “and smoke” in the first sentence.

Seciion 1004.1.1, Exception

Delete "Exception: Where approved by the building official,
the actual number of oceupants for whom each occupled
space, floor or building is designed, although less than those
determined by calculation, shall be permitied to be used In
the determination of the design oceupant load.”

Revisions to the IBC

Section 1005.1

Insert: {within the paragraph; after} The means of egress
width shall not be less than required by this section, The folat
width of meansof egress in inches{mmn}shal not be less than
the total cccupant load served by the means of egress
mutiplied by 0.3 inches (7.61 mm} per aceupant for
staitways.

Exception: Board and Care 0.4; Health Care — Sgrinided 0.3;
Heatth Care Non-sprinkled 0.6.

Revisions to the IBC

Section 1005.1 (continuead)
Delete: "and by 0.2 inches (5.08 mm) per occupant for other
egress components”

Inseri: The total width of means of egress in inches {mm}
shall not be less than the total cccupant load served by the
means of egress muttiplied by 0.2 inches (5.08 mm) per
occupant for cther egress components.

Exception: Board and Care 0.2; Health Care Sprinkled 8.2;
Health Care Mon-sprinkled 0.5,

Revisions to the IBC

Section 1008.1.9.8
Delets “E” from the Group reference in two (2) locations in the
first paragraph.

Section 1014.3
Delete ail language in Section 1014.3 and insed "See NFPA
101-2009 Table A7.6”in it's place.

Revisions to the IBC

Section 1015.2.1
insert: “and exit gischarge”

Whare two exits or exif access doorways are required from
any portion of the exit access, the exit doors or exit access
doorways and exit discharge shal be piaced a distance apart
equal to not less than on-ha¥ of the length of the maximum
overall diagonal dimension of the building or area to be served
measured in a straight fine belween ext doors or exit access
doorways and oxit discharge. :

13



CB Training Fall 2011

Revisions to the IBC

Section 1016, Table 1016.1

1. Delete "E” from the occupancy column as one of the use
graups.

2_ Insenta nsw row in the column titted "Single Use”

3. Insert“E" In the Single Use occupancy column

4, Insert"150" in the without sprinkler system {feef) column

5, Insert®200" in the sprinkling system {feet) column

10/19/2011

Revisions to the IBC

Section 1016, Table 1016.1 (continued)
1. Delete “S-1 and $-2° from the occupangy ¢olumn

2, Inset®S-1 and §-2" in the occupancy column &5 a new
oW

3. Insent“See NFPA101-2000 Takle AT.67

J)
RELA ARETWEEY
FUEL LGI D ANTFSE ERCUERANCE

Sometables contain
niHmerous notes and
conditions which mustbe
considered to arnve 2t an
accurata detenmination of
the data

|
Using Tables and Figures

Let's take a look at Table 367.1(2)

o The (2}indicates that the {ableis the second table
in the 307.1 sub-seclion.

1. Whatis the maximum afowable quantity in gations of highly toxic
malerial that may be in use in the control area before having to
classify part {or the enlire} building as a high-hazard occupancy?

Using Tables and Figures

Let's take a fook at Table 1018,1

1. The owner is propasing a multunit residential buiding with the exit
served by a comidor. The proposed occupancy is 12. The fire-
resistancerating of the coreddor is .5 hour?

Is this permissible?

14



CB Training Fall 2011

e/’“ﬁ{

Using Tables and Figures

Lel's take a look at Table 1405.3.1

1. isinsulaled sheathing with R-value =3.75 over 2xB wa'i
permissibla in Bar Harbor, Mame?

10/19/2011

OK... Got the hang of it?

Let's do an overview of the code

Chapter 1 Overview

Administration

Chapter 1 Administcation

in addition to establishing the scope of the code, Chapter |
identifies which buildings and structures are covered.

Chapter 1 Administeation

The Building Cfficial charged with the administration
and enforcement of building regulations has a great
responsibility.

A responsibility that will impact the buildings and
citizens long after the Code Official is gone!

Cha pter 1 Scope and Administration

The Building Official has the responsibility to establish
that the homes in which the citizens of the community
reskle, and the buildings in which they work are
designed and constructed to be structuratly stable with
adequate means of egress, light and ventiation,

15



CB Training Fall 2011

C h d pte r 1 Scope and Administration

He or she must also assure that the buildings wilt
provide a minimum acceptable level of protection to
life and property from fire.

10/19/2011

C h d pte rl Scope and Administration

Chapter 1 contains two parts:
o Part 1 — Scope and Application

Contains all issues refated 1o the scope and infent of
the code, as well as the applicability of this code
relative to other standards and laws that might also
be applicable on a given building project, such as
federal or state.

Ch a pi'e r 1 Scope and Administration

Chapter 1 contains two paris:
o Part 2 - Administration and Enforcement

Contains all issues related to the duties and powers
of the Building Officlal, the issuance of permits and
cerificates of occupansy, and other related
operational ilems.

101 Title, Scope and References to Other Codes
102 Applicability and Existing Structures

04  Duties and Authority of the Buiiding Officlal
0§ Requirements for Permits

SECTION 108  Posting Live Loads Greater Than 50 psf
ON 107  Requirements for Construction Documents

No more fees!

SECTION 110 inspaction Duties
SECTION 111  Certificates of Occupancy
SECTION 112 utiity Connections

BECTION M vioitorsof the-Code-

Just
kidding!

SECTION 118  Stop Work Orders
SECTION 116  unsale Stuctures and Equipment

16



CB Training Fall 2011

True or False?

The code is in part, intended fo preclude innovative
ideas and the advancement of technology by
prohibiting the use of alternate materials, designs
and matheds of construction.

Quiz

Every permit issued shall become invalid unless
the work on the site authorized by such permit is
commenced within days after it's issuance.

C h a pte r 1 Scope and Administration

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

10/19/2011

e

| Quiz

Work belng complated that does notrequire a

permit need not comply with the pravisions of the
code.

True or False?

Quiz

“The Building Official, upan notification, shall
make the inspections set forth In the code.”

There are a fotal of required Inspections.
A3

B. 6

C. 10

Chapter 2 Overview

Definitions

17



CB Training Fall 2011

| e

Chapter 2 Definitions

Thare are twa distinct methodologles used in the
definitions contained in Chapter 2

The actual definitions are located as follows:

10/19/2011

Maﬁ""‘j—"\_“‘*‘;‘

Cha pte r 2 Defnitions

The actual definitions are located as follows:

J

Cha pter 2 pefinitons

Whoere that oceurs, the definition could appearin either
the section or the subsection.

Theterms listed in Chapter 2 will ditect you ¢ the correct Sectionor
Subsectionwhere the definitionis found.

Exarnple: Fire Resistance. See Section 702.1.

Chapter 2 Definitions

AlsO...

Where a word In the text of the code i that
S.

word is a defined term in the definition:

Example:

406.1.5 Automatic garaga dogropgners. Auntomaticgarage door
openers, if provided, shalt accordance with UL325,

Chapter 2 pefaitons

As such, every word, term, and punctiation mark can
impact the meaning of the intended result.

Codes, by nature are highly technlcal documents.

Cha pter 2 Definitions

This code, with it's broad scope of applicability, includes
terms that are used in a variety of construction trades.

These lerms often have multiple meanings,
depanding on the context or discipline of the
current discussion,

18



CB Training Fall 2011

Chapter 2 oefinitions

For thase reasons, it is critical that we all share a
common core of understanding of the terms that
define our work.

Quiz
The officer or other designated authority charged with the

administration and enforcement of this code, or a duly
authorized represaentative is known as the

A. Code Enforcement Officer
B. Municipal Inspector

C. Building Official

Chapter 3 Overview

Use and Qegupancy Classification

10/19/2011

f—"

Quiz
Let's ook up the definition of "building”.

Any structure used or irdended for supporting or
sheltering any use or occupancy,

Chapter 2 Definitions

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

L

Ch apte r3 useand Occupancy Classification

Chapter 3 provides for the classification of buildings,
structures and parts thereof based on the purpose or
purposes for which they are used.

19



CB Training Fall 2011

Cha pter 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

For the most part, it is really about fire safety.

10/19/2011

Cha pter 3 Useand Ocoupancy Classification

I early code development, the primary focus was to
protect the building from fire.

The train of thoughi was if the building was
protected, so would be the occupants.

Cha pte I' 3 Use and Ocou pancy Classification

More modern evolutions involve the concept of
“gquivalent isk™.

This concept recognizes that an acceptable
{evel of risk against fire damage can be
achieved by [miting the height and area of
buildings according to the occupancy and
construction types.

Ch apter 3 Useand Occupancy Classification

The concept of equivalent risk invotves three
interdependent considerations:

e P T T
- ocoupa

- areas and buikiing heigh

3, Lovelof fire reslstance p'ros'nc:le.d'by the type of
construction.

Cha pte I' 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

This can be sean by reviewing Tables 801 and 502.

These indicate fire-resistance ratings of
major building assemblies in relation to five
classifications for types of construction.

Ch a ptEi‘ 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

“Fheseindicate fire-resistance ratings of major buildingassemblies
inrelationte fiveclassificationsfor types of construction.”

Type | construgtion requires the highest fire-resistance
rating for structural elements.

Type V construction, which l;deslgnated asa
combustible type of construction, requires the jeast
amount of fire-resistance-rated structural slements.

20



CB Training Fall 2011

Cha pter 3 Useand Occupancy Classification

BARLE i)
DA HICA0 § LD LSt ast

ALLOVARL | R
B Mg pary et Dl o ol K Shay ik i s g g phee
o moRs et ¥ I TR B 'y s o G A BN o S
=t Lty Tre
[z M S N S UC SOV T WO - 1
— rraal
] a A de | oha Fonde [ abe ¢ owbe | oude | ss
2 a ate [ o fowhe | oabe owhe foute | ocie
4 ) -2 s L i
. E e [ owbe | whe | o R ale | o
" b E i f i 3
i = s
s H E obe | ke | wle | b ;oal | WA ]
N s r 3 T .
& st | it | ophe § ophe D ple | st | oaia
™ s y ) v i ¥
i E ab [ ode | olo §ophe owle | wde | o
- . = i 7 N T )
A ] eho | oo § nfa § oobe oake | abe | ole

helghts and areas, and typas of canstruction become apparent.

Hwe look at Table 503, tiis relationship between group cigssification, allowable

Cha pter 3 Useand Occupancy Classification

In modern code development, the focus has shifted
from profecting the building fo protecting Hfe.

Even so, occupancy classiication plays a key role in
organizing and preseriting appropriate protective
measures in buildings.

Cha pter 3 Useand Occupancy Classification

Take a look at your handout...

L nement a7 other Cortrmgsity baiby (ot 1o ret, Bt ully,

e E R I TP A Lormtodut st st dSng ) 12 00T IRPVLAR

F S R S IO

\se and OfCupancy Seetoce book for detels
Classificazior: ; S
bassamthy 40050 T e tectine 308 Biamgtes i T T 3
Prodiction a8 didwirg of Growd Al Aztoy rim.rnhmn.ivnoww-’:ﬂefthié
e ifirrale g sty TN yuticnwith sodience Traaters
Foodard, o arink Greua el Byrqethatts, Kgtlolibs. Resarants.

W Taata) Teve sy

orsup. redreataon of Greud A3 Aritere it anais, At alnas Boxl g,

L <4 a0t elasg fipe Exhbrien kbl funirad partars, Gymenbars

10/19/2011

Cha pte F 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

Save that thought!

More on this latert

Cha pte r 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

As you may have guessad...

The purpose of this chapier is fo classify a buiding,
structure or part thereof into a group based on the
specific purpose for which it Is deslaned er occupled.

SEGTION301  Scope

SECTION 302 Classification / Occupancy Groups
SECTION 303  Assembly (Gatherings)
SECTION304 susincss

SECTION 38 Educstional

SECGTION 308 Factory and industrial

QEQHQN 307 High Hazard

21



CB Training Fall 2011

ECTION 308 |nstitutional
SECTION309 Mercantie
N 319 Residential
11 Storage
2 Utility and Miscellaneous

10/19/2011

i

” Quiz

Under the occupancy classifications, a college
would be considered

A. an Educational Group
B. an Institutional Group

C. a Business Group

Quiz

Which of the folicwing is considered tobe a
maoderats hazard in the Factory Group?

A Afoundry
B. Metal fabrication

C. Abakery

Quiz

Whatis the maximum amount {iquid gallons) of
Class Il organic peroxide that may be In use n an
open predustion system?

C h a pte I“ 3 Use and Occupancy Classification

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

Chapter 4 Overview

Special Detailed Requirements Based On Use And
Oceupancy

22



CB Training Fall 2011

Cha pte r4 Special Detailed Requirements Based
On Use And Occupancy

This chapter contalns provisions that may alter the
requirements found elsewhere in the code.

10/19/2011

/ﬁ‘:’
Chapter 4 special Detaited Requirements Based
On Use And Occupansy

However, the genesal requirements of the code
stiff apply unless modified within this chapter.

Chapter 4 speciat Detailed Requirements Based
On Use And Occupancy

In gther words, the provisions in Chapter 4
superseds the requiremsnis of all other Sections.

Cha pter 4 special Detailed Requirements Based
On Use And Occupancy

In addition to atl of this...

/ﬂ
Cha pte I 4 special Detailed Requirements Based
On Use And Oceupancy

Those requirements {other codes) must also be complad
with when addressing such cccupanciesin this code that
Involve flammable and combustible liquids.

The same ¢ouid hold true for instances involving
plumbing codes, mechanical codes, etc. as they may
involve ’

o piping for hazardous materials or;
o exhaustducting for hazardous materals.

Cha pte r4g Spacial Detailed Requirements Based
On Use Ang Occupancy

Se the overall purpose of the chapteris to provide
one-stop shopping for the provisions of the code
that are applicable o speclal uses and
occupancies.

23



CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Ch a pte r 4 Special Detailed Requirements Based On Ch a pte r 4 Special Detailed Requirements Based On
Useand Qecupancy Use and Oceupancy

SECTION40f Scope SECTION408 Group 1-3 (Correctional Centers)

SECTION402 Covered Mall and Open Mall Buidings SECTION409  Motion Picture Projection Rooms

SECTION 403 High-Rise Buildings SEQTION 410 Stagesand Platforms

SECTION404  Atiums SECTION 411  SpeciatAmusement Buildings

SECTION 408  Underground Buikdings SECTION 412  Avcraft Related Occupancies

SECTION 408  Motor Vehicle Related Occupancies SECTION413  Combustible Sterage

SECTION40T  Group (-2 (Institutional) SECTION 414  Razardous Materials

Ch a pte rg Spectal Detalled Requirements Based On Ch a pte rd Special Detailed Reguirements Based On
Use and Sccupancy Use and Ceeupancey

N418  Groups H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4 and H-5 (High Hazard) SECT 2 Ambulatory Health Care Facilities
418  Applcation of Flammable Finishes SECTION423  Storm Shelters

{7 Drying Reoms

ON 418  Organic Coatings

ON 419 Live/Work Units

N420 Groupsi-1, R-1, R-2, R-3 {InstitutionalResidential)
N421 Hydrogen Cutoff Rooms

| Quiz Quiz

in determining the required means of egress fora l '?
covered mall, the number of cccupants for whom mle Or False *
means of egress are to be provided shall be based on
A numberof parking spaces available. In a high-rise buiiding, the emergency power system
must provide power for ifumination of exterior fire
B. gross leasable area and occupant load, escape systems.

C. limitations of flow in the automatic sprinkler
system.

24



CB Training Fall 2011

True or False?

When fabrgating scenery and other items used as
props and stage decorations, any material may be used
as the uses of these are only temporary in nature,

10/19/2011

Quiz

A rasidantial akrcraft hangar sha have a minimum of
means of egress.
A one
B. two

C.three

Ch apte r 4 Special Detalled Requlrements Based

On Use and Occupancey

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

Chapter 5 Overview

General Bullding Helghts and Areas

Cha pte I'5 General Building Heights 2nd Areas

The main purpose of Chapter 5 is to regulale the size of
structures based cn

1. the specific hazards assoclated with thelr occupancy
and;

2. the malerials of which thay are constructed.

Cha pte 'S5 Generat Building Heights and Areas

Chapter 5 also provides for adjustments to the allowabla
areas and heights, based on the presence of fire
protection systems for building occupants and fire service
pearsonnelin the eventof a fire.

25



CB Training Fall 2011 | 10/19/2011

conshuetion for a bufding. -

...with the determination of the minimum required type of
construction based on the use and size of the buikilng.

SECTION 801 Scopo

SECTION802 Defiitons
SEGTION 503 General Building Height and Area Limitations
SECTION 504  Bunding Height

Misapplication of Chapter 5 can result in a multitude of

refated errors Ia subsequent cede application, since many SECTION 508 Mezzanines

code requirements depend on the type of construction i~ T

thats required for the building. SECTION 508  Buiding Area Modifications
SECTION 807  Unlimited Area Buildings

Chapter 5 General Building Heights and Areas QU|Z
SEGTION 808  Mixed Use and Occupancy Abasementis defined as a story thatis
SECTION 509  Special Provisions

A. atleast £0% below the finished grade
B. does not have a full daylight walk out

G.is not a story above grade plang

26



CB Training Fall 2011

f"""%

e

r Quiz

The purpose of Section 504 is to provide for increases
in allowable building heights

Truwe or False?

10/19/2011

True or False?

Regardless of where they are located, mezzanines are
always allowed to utilize a single means of egress.

Ch APTEr S cenerot suitding Heights and Areas

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

Chapter 6 Overview

Types of Construction

’:Q/ﬁ
Cha pte I' 6 Tyoes of Construction

Chapter 6 contains the requirements to classify
bulidings inte one of five types of construgtion.

Cha pte I' 6 Types of Construction

Correct classification of a buikling by it's type of
construction is essential.

If a buikding is placed in an incorrect construction
classification {for example, one thatis foo
restrictive), il's owner may be penalized by the
increased construction costs,

27



CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Cha pter 6 Types of Construction

On the other hand...

if a buiiding is placed in a classification that is foo
lenient, it wit not be constructed in & manner that
accounts for the relative risks associated with it's } g tablish the b

size or function. *Equivalent Risk Theory® on which the entire
isbased. S

/M

Cha pte re6 Types of Construction Cha pte I 6 Types of Construetion
The purpose of classifying buildings or structures The code requires every building fo ba classified as
by their type of construction is 1o account for the one of five possible fypes of construction.

response or participation that a bulldings structure
will have in a fire.

Type |
Type I}
. Type il
Type IV
. TypeV

(i.e., it's resistance or contribution to the fire)

LRV P

Cha pte reé Types of Construction : Cha pte F 6 Types of Construction
1. Typel
2. Typell Also considered are the minimum fire-resistance
’ Each type of construction denotes the ratings of the structural elemenis in the building
3. Typelll kinds of materials that are used. having that rating.
4, TypelV
pe 1. Ghours
5. TypeV & Noncombustible steel 2. 1hour
< Concrefe
o Masonry 3. 1% hours
o Combustible (wood, plastic, etc.} 4. 2hours
o Heavy timber
5. Jhours

28



CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Cha pte I 6 Typesof Construction Cha pte F 6 Typos of Construction
‘Fypa | and 1| construction have butdiag elements
that are noncombustible. Type |, H, 11, and V are further subdivided
into two categories:

Type lll construction as noncombustivie exterior

walls and combustible or noncombustible interior 1. Typel iAand I8
olaments.
2. Typall  ItAandilB
Type [V construction has noncombustible exterior 3. Typelll  HAaadila
walis and heavy timber interior elements.
4. Type vV
Type V construction has building elements that 5 TypeV  VAandVB
are combustible.

SECTION 601 scope SECTION 601 scope
SECTION €02 Construstion Classification SECTIONGRZ  Construction Classification
SECTION 603 Combustivle Material in Type  and Ii Construction SECTION 603  Combustivie Material in Type | and Il Construction

To get a betler lock at the Types and Categories,
let’s have a look af Table 601,

~Table 601 ' ~Table 601

Fire Resistance Rating Requirements for Building Elements Fire Resistance Rating Requirements for Building Elements
eran SR hija Ve iy TTE
I
¥ ¥ 1 ] 1 q Kt i L]
3 E 1 & z I L} o
T X 1 1] ) ] 3T i q
Ve aie s

At T oaatit 3 1 1 L o £ i gAbaE L3 o
4 2 T L 3 L] LU 1 o 2 ks 1 L ] a " i L)
= ==k v v L ¥ @ ¥t 3 @ w 1 ¥ 3 r i =1 k] L

Table 601 has three components. .. Cafegory A and B are notdefined in the code.

il

Top row ists the Types of construction and the categories
2 Left column list the regulated building elements
3. Each cell contains the minimum required fire-resislance rating

The designations simply refer to the hourly fire-resistance
rating required for that building element.

29



CB Training Fall 2011

Table 601

Fire Resistance Rating Requirements for Building Elements

" " M TR L 1 1w
BALALELuEY Yy T r ) > I .
v stwdew Vi 3 3 1 a " ' [
eatng mea
[ 1 a 2 r 3 3 ¢
strer 1 g L 2 »r i [}
ST Py sre-atie %
[ 4 o ¢ [srsemaie| o [
1 El 1 L) " i ¢
a * ] w +* a

Category A always has a higher fire-resistance
rating than Category B.

Table 601

10/19/2011

Fire Resistance Rating Requirements for Building Efements

[ X

Ty Tt i 131y
A 1] I L] Lad A" [}
1 a 1 o »r i 4
1 a z r z 1 4
Fl 8 L ¢ 1 1 )
e Tutie B4
] ] ) b Febcuetanis| o e
1 q 1 v * 1 ]
" a v o wt " 4

Sometimes Category A and 8 are referred to as
“Protected” and “Unprotected” construction respectivaly.

Please nole these terms do nol refer to whether the buildingis
equippedwith astomalic sprinkiers.

mm— T

Table 601

Fire Resistance Rating Requirements for Building Elements

et wan e ran vip
L bas It . T
il ‘ 0 ¥ ¥ ® 0 ¥ FURE Y
it vl e s M y o - N N
e e s
e N s f a » ’ : 1 »
¥ ir s s 1 ° m 1 o
e e
f [ [ L] o o el ica WILE ° L)
B ) B - 1
s T S L R
et U e [ L e e

Please note that we have left the notes {a through g} off
from these stides simply for clarity.

Aswith any tableor chart, these must be applied toarrive at the correct result.

Let’s see how all of this works

The Cccupancy Groups detal the uses and functions
cccurring inside the building, and fimits construction
based cn use.

/ﬂ

So what are these “Iimils™?.

Let’s see how all of this works

Let’s see how all of this works

Again, the Construction Types are:

1. Typel
2, Typell
3. Typelll

4. TypalV

5. TypeV

Non combustible high-rise
Non combustible low-rise

MNoncombustible exterior walls and
combustible or noncombustivle interor
slements

MNoncombustible exterior walls and heavy
timber interior elements

Buiding elements that are combustible

30



CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

Type |} Construction - Noncombustible

Type | or Il Construction

This buliding similar to Type | except for height

Type 1 - Noncombustible low-rise

T Type IV Construction - Noncombustible exterior
S walls and heavy timber interior elements

UNMA Student Center— Type 1l Construction
Actually three buiidings separated by fire walls

31



CB Training Fall 2011

10/19/2011

Animporant part of the code Is to protect the assets

and economic health of the community
g =t o - T

AB&B in the making in "No

Codebandg®.

P

The code sets limits on

a Use

o Area

o Height

o Construction Type

Loads
{Seclion 16)

GENERAL DESIGN REQUIREMENTS
LOAD COMBINATIONS

o
o

o DEADLOADS

o LIVE LOADS

o SNOWLOADS

o WIND LOADS

o SOILLATERALLOADS

o RAIN LCADS

o FLOODLOADS

o EARTHQUAKE LOADS

o STRUCTURAL INTEGRITY

32



CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

So what else do we need to

Loads \

{Seclion 16) consider?
Good designers and bullding officlals have the We have talked about buiiding planning, occupancy
insight to advise clients to plan for future aroups and uses, and limiations to prevent losses

needs and uses. from fires within the building.

Agood example of this Is floor loads. Whatlf a future use
wauld require a higher load capacity than what is
proposed in the construction documents?

Fire can aftack a building from one of two Table 802 establishes the minimum fire-resistance
places ' rating for all exterior walls, based on separation
distance. The required ratings are based on:
o Fuelload

o ltcan orginate from Inslkde the buikding, or

o itean spread from an adjacent building o o Prabable fire intensity of the various
other cutside source, occupancy classifications

o Fire separation distance

Ta b [e 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Requirements for exterior
Walls Based on Fire Separation Distance 2

Ta ble 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Requirements for exterior
Walls Based on Fire Sepasation Distance 2@

Onee determined, the required fire-resistance rating is obtained

To use the table, you must first determing first determing
by referring to the appropriate rows and columns.

Ceeupancy Classification and Fire Separation Distance.

Please note the fire-resistance rating requirements of Table 601

For Fire Separation Distance, see Figure 802(1}and 602{2}.
{based on constructiontype) also eppiy.

33



CB Training Fall 2011

’__ﬂ/
Table 602 rireresistance Rating Requirements for exterior
Wails Based on Fire Separation Distance 4

Exterior foad bearingwalis must comply with the higher of fhe two
ralings specified Iin Tables 601 and 602,

Ta bEe 602 fire-Resistance Rating Requirements for exterior
Walls Based on Fire Separation Distance 2

Theimaginary line may be at any location between ihe sinictures,
Wherever ihe line is established, fire separation distance for each wall

must be measured from the line, and wall and wall opening protection
based on the distance to theassumed location.

N

Ta b'e 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Reguirements fer exterior
Walls Based an Fire Separation Distance 2

R LR B AN Lk LDy MANECY EFOP COLF ALy LR
o LT AT
o Fescre i onnd rawEs ABTIINESE

Tay ] 3 T

w
Ctas

Sexcs 1

W
Beiex A
Ctas

I [P N
FY [P

1
3
'
]

3oam i

Let's try it outl

Elementary School 26 fest House

TypeiliA
consinction

10/19/2011

»—",
Ta b I e 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Requirements for exterior
Wails Based on Fire Separation Distance ®

Wherelhere are two buildings on the samea {of, an imagirary property
line must be assumed between the buildingsin accordance with
Section 705.3

Ta b |e 602 Fire-Resistance Rating Requirements for exterior
Walls Based on Fire Separation Distance >

RS AATON DA S ) v EEFNY [ MR Hraa e
b5 reeere hdd o AN ALLIILESEY

ey i v ¥ i

N [y ¥ ¥ ¥

$sreu ches 3 ) H

L] E 1 K

ESTTLERS v 1 L )

otas 1 ) &

T [ [ 3 )

As with all tables and charts, be sure to apply
the notes and conditions that are published on
the chart to arrive at the correct resuit.

Quiz

What s the minimum fire-resistance rating for
the exterior bearing waii of the school?

{Proposed} 25fest {Existing )
El ySchool House
TypsillA
Canstruction

34



CB Training Fall 2011

Quiz

If our efementary schoolwas to be of Typa |
construction, could we use fire-retardant-treated
wood in a nonbearing exterior wali where no fire
rating Is required?

Yes or No?

10/19/2011

So why is all of this so important?

We can't always go back and change what we did years before,

But we can make things
better and safer going
forward/

So let’s put all of this to use

An applicant proposes a new building for 2 planned
business

The family is proposing to build a small store:

They will be selling paint and wallpaper, along with the supplics
and equipment tha! their customers will need.

They want to supply contractors in the area as well, and expect o
stock Jadders, staging and the usual variely of tools and
equipment the contractor will be interested in.

There needs to be an office, a display area and storage area,
including a covered outside storage area for ladders, staging etc.

They own a five acre lot that has ne other structures on it, and do
not intand fo add any other use In the future.

35



CB Training Fall 2011

Whatis the Occupancy Group for this
business?

e

What about fire-resistance ratings
and separation distances?

A B Acres
B
P> ,
Mercantile
D 10,000 12
| SeeTable 705.8.
Location. Separation Max Arga of
Distancs Extarior Wal
Openings
C ANorth sids 30
B East Side Over 30
C South Side Gver3d'
C West Side 10

10/19/2011

If the applicant is planning on 10,000 fi2, what
construction type can the designer recommend?

TYPEL TYPENL TYPELI TYPETY TVFEY
A B A B A HT A B
HEIGHT _ - "
(et UL 6@ 65 55 & 55 & 5 4
GEOLP STORIES(S) AREA (A}

M s UL o % 2 4 z 4 3 1
A ELA u, 500 12500 500 12500 20500 o) Q000

Alt construction types except Type VB ean provide

the desired 10,000 fi2,
A SAcres
B
<1 Mercantile
D 10,000 f¢
Location Separation
Distance
1 ANorih side 30"
B £asiSide Over3g'
G South Side Cver 30
D West Side 10
C
Fire-resistarice rating for exterior bearing wa
Fire separation distance - R

Ch da pte I‘ G Types of Construction

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

36



CB Training Fall 2011

Chapter 7 Overview

Fire-Reslistance-Rated Construction

10/19/2011

Ch d pte I 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Conslruclion

Chapter 7 provides detailed requirements for fire-
resistance-rated construction, including structural
members, walls, paritions, and horizonta!l assemblies.

Cha pte I' 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction

Other paris of the code tell us when cerain fire-resistance-
rated elements are required,

e'etem:é:iié ans constructed,
re protested, and
re protected.

Cha pte r 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction

Fire-resistance-rated construction is often referred to as
“passive protection”.

These building slemonts provide resistance to the advance
of fire, as opposed to active fire protection systems, such
as automatic sprinklers which serve {0 suppress a fire,

Cha pter 7 tire-Resistance-Rated Construction

Fire-resistance-rated construction is often referred to as
"passive protection”.

C h a pte r 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Consiruction

01 scope

02 Defnttions

03  Fire-Resistance Ratings and Fire Tests
4

Fire-Resistance Rating of Structural Members

Fire Walis

SECTION 707 Fire Barriers

05 Exterior Walls
]
l

37



CB Training Fall 2011 10/19/2011

B S
Ch a pte r 7 fire-Resistance-Rated Construction Ch a pte r 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction
SECTION 708  ghaft Enclosures SEGTION 718  Opening Protectives
SECTIONT09  Fire Partitions SECTIONTI8 Ducis and Alr Transfer Openings
SECTION 710  Smoke Barrers SEGTIONT1] Concealed Spaces
SECTION 711  Smoke Parliions SECTIONT18 rire-Resistance Requirements for Plaster
SECTIONT12 Horizontal Assemblies SEQTIONT19  Thermaland Sound Insulating Materials
SECTION 713 Penclrations SECTIONT20 Prescriptive Fize Resistance
SECTION 714 Fire-ResistantJolnt Systems SECTION 721 Calculated Fire Resistance

Tfue oY Fa]se? Fite barsiers shall be constructed of

A. Stesl, masonry cr concrete only

The fire-resistance rating of a floor assembly separating
mixed oceupancies Is the same regardiess of occupancy

classifications on sither side of the ficor assembly. B. Materials permitted in the bufiding type of

construction

C. Gypsum based products

Quiz
Ch Epter 7 Erre-resistance-Rated Construction

Solong as it s propery protecled, an opening for 8

l&lurécii%f:hute may be located in any room or space it the Questlons ?
Comments?
» L] ?
True or False? Discussion?

38



CB Training Fall 2011

Chapter 8 Overview

Interior Finishes

10/19/2011

Cha pte r 8 interior Finishes

Past fire experience has shown that interor finish and
decorative materials are key elements in the
developmentand spread of fire.

These materials often become involved in the eady
stages of the fire, and contribute to eardy growih and

spread of the fire.

Cha pter 8 interior Finishes

The provisions of Chapter 8 require materals used as
interior finishes and decorations to have a flame spread
index or meet certain lame propagation criteria based
on the relative fire hazard associated with the
occupancy.

Chapter 8 interior Finishes

The design professional or applicantis responsible for
determining and providing data {o support the permit
appfication.

The Buildiag Officlal will evaluate the information to
ascertain that compliance is achioved.

Cha pte '8 Interior Finishes

Chapter 8 €on

ter § é ddrancs requirements for
conbroling F; C

tildings by restricting

interior finish nalera

891 Scope
Definitions
Waltand Ceiting Finishes

Eoad
=3

Tt X

Ee=d

=
E=
iy

Interior Floor Finish

O 0 ) 0 X0
=
00 SO0

B-cd

05  Combustible Matedals in Types] and Il
Construction

39



CB Training Fall 2011

06 Decoralive Materials and Trim
07  msulation

I
SEGTION 808  Acoustical Celiing Systems

10/19/2011

Quiz

True or False?

All materials, including wall paper are required to be
tested for flame spread and smoke-developed index
in accordance with Chapter 8.

Where a minimum of Class B materal is required as
an interior finish,

A. Aclass C material may be substituted,
B. Aclass Amaterial may be substituted.

C. No substitute materials are permissible.

Quiz

11 an factory oceupancy classification, what is the
interior wall and ceiling finish requirement for an non-
sprinkled corridor?

Cha pte P8 (nerior Finishes

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

Chapter 9 Overview

Fire Protection Systems

40



CB Training Fall 2011

Cha pte ¥ O Fire Protection Systems

Fire protection systems may serve ong or more
purposes In providing adequate protection from fire
and hazardous materials exposure,

Cha pte I'9 Fire Protection Systems

Generally, the requirements are based on the
occupancy and the height and area of the building.

These are the factors that most affect fire-fighting
capabilities and the relative hazard of a specific
space or area.

Cha pte r 9 Fire Protection Systems

Al fire protection requirements contalned in the code
must be consldered as a package, or overall system.

Non cempliznce with any part of it may have
catastrophic consequences on the other parts of the
sysfem.

10/19/2011

Cha pte I'9 Fire Protection Systems

The purpose of Chapter 9 is to prescriba the
minimum requirements for an active system or
systems of fire protection to perform the following
functions:

A. Todelectihe fire
B. To alert the coeupants or fire depariment
C. Toconteol smoke

D. To conteol or extinguish the fire

Cha pte F 9 Fire Protection Systems

Generally, the requirements are based on the
occupancy and the height and area of the building.

The provisions of Chapter 9 are Just one aspect of the
overall fire protection systemn of a building or
structure.

|
Cha pter 9 Fie protection systems

All fize protection requirements contained in the code
must be considered as & package, or overall system,

Falure to install the system in accordance with
provisions of the code andfor manufaciurers
instructions may result in loss of life and property, due
to loss of performance of the fire protecticn system.

41



CB Training Fall 2011

i in:Chapter @ should be
e safety provisions.

Ch 2 pte r 9 Fire Protection Systems

SECTION 908  Emergency Alasm Systems

908 Smoke Control Systems

Smoke and Heat Vents

1 Fire Command Center

ON912 Fire DepartmentConnections

13 Fire Pumps

14 Emergency Responder Safety Features

,v/’ﬂ
Quiz

tr group H oceupancies, manual fire alarms,
automatic fire extinguishing, and emergeacy
alarm systems

A. Shal be monitored by an approved
supervising station

B. Shall be tested by a certifying 2gency

C. Are not required

10/19/2011

t Scope
902 Dafinitions
903 Automatic Sprinkler Systems
04 Afernative Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems
05 Standpipe Syslems
QN 908  Portable Fire Extinguishers
7 Fire Alarm and Detaction Systams

Ch a p‘te r 9 fire Protection Systems

SECTION 816  Emergency ResponderRadio Coverage

,/ﬂf
Quiz

Poriable fire extinguishers having a gross weight
of more than 40 pounds

A. Shali be monttored by an approved
supervising station.

B. Shall be installed so their tops are not
more than 3.5 fest above the foor,

C. Shall not be used.

42



CB Training Fall 2011

Quiz

tanual fire alarm boxes shall be either red or
yellow in color.

True or False?

10/19/2011

C h a pte r 9 flre Protection Systems

Questions?
Comments?
Discussion?

Chapter 10 Overview

Means of Egress

Cha pte r 10 Means of Egress

{o safequard He:in the presence of firei:

As you can see by now, a primary focus of thls code is |

Integral to this purpose, is a path of egress for
occupants to escape and avoid a firg.

/
Cha pter 10 Means of Egress

Means. of egress can be cons»dered the
lrfelme of a bullding: R

The principles on which means of egress are based
and that form the fundamental criteria for
requirements are fo provide a system:

Chapter 10 wteans of Egress

The pringiples on which means of egress are based
and that form the fundamentalcriteria for
requiremants are to provide a system:

o Thatwil give occupants aflernative paths of
travel to a place of safely to avold fire.

o Thatwill shetter cccupants from fire and the
producis of combustion.

43



CB Training Fall 2011

Chapter 10 Means of Egress

The principles on which means of egress are based
and that form the fundamental ¢riteria for
requirements are 1o provide a system:

o That will accommodate alf occupants of the
strictura.

o Thatls clear, unobstructed, well marked and
illuminated and in which 2l componenis are
underthe control of the userwithout requiring
any tools, keys or special knowledge or effort.

Cha pte F 10 Means of Egress

Life safely is a function of ime...

o Time for detection
o Time for notification
o Time for safe egress

The fire spread over time Is also a citical factor in
the equation.

10/19/2011

Cha pte r 10 Means of Egress

if we look at history, we can clearly see that many
instances that have resulted in loss of life were
directly attributabis to fafures in the above
mentioned strategies.

_M‘j —
Chapter 10 means of Egress

This chapter addresses the means available o
relocate or.gvacuate the buliding oceupants.:

o Exitaccess

There are three main components

of any egress system, o Ext

o Exit discharge

;»—-/’
Chapter 10 Means of Egress

o Exitaccess

There are three main components

of any egress system. o Bxit

o Exit discharge
A zanal approach to egress provides a general basis

of the chapters format through regutation of these
three components.

Ch d pter 10 Means of Egress

ECTION 1001 Administration
TION 1002 Definitions
1003 General Means of Egress
N 1004 OccupantLoad
ON 1008 Egress Width
ON1006 Means od Egress llumination

SECTION 1907 Accessible Means of Egress

44



CB Training Fall 2011

SECTION 1008 Doors, Gates and Turasties

SEGTION 1009 Stsiways

SECTION 1910 Remps

SECTION 1011 exitsigns

SECTION 1012 Handeaiis

SECTION 1013 Gueros

BECHONJ014 ExitAccess (Sea NFPA 101-2008 Table A 7.6)

10/19/2011

SECTION 1018 Exitand Exit Access Doorways
SECTION 1018 ExitAccess Travel Distance
17 Alsles

Corridors

§
019 Egress Bakienies
0 Exits

SECTION 1021 Numberof Exits 2nd Continuity

22 Exit Enclosures

N1023 Exit Passageways

1024 Luminous Egress Path Markings
25 Horizontal Exits

SECTION 1028 Exterior Exit Ramps and Stairways
SECTION 1027 Exit Discharge

SECTION1028 Ascemby

Ch a pte r 10 Means of Egeess

SECTION 1020 Emergency Escape and Rescue

And we're finally donel

This Time, You Get To Ask
the Questions!/

SUOTSSNOSI(]
SSTUDWUIO))
ssuonsang)

45



